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the averages are calculated using the sound power levels
measured at the same time. the noise rating based on a single

measurement is different from the average rating used to
calculate the ratings that are shown on the meter. if the average
exceeds the maximum noise rating, the maximum noise rating
should be used to calculate the average. the maximum sound

pressure level measured at any time during the period selected.
the maximum noise exposure level for a 15-minute period is 115
dba. noise exposure above this level can result in hearing loss,
which is the most commonly reported health effect associated

with noise. the levels shown on the meter are simply the
maximum sound pressure levels measured during the period. the

actual noise exposure at any time during the period cannot be
known, but the average of the maximum levels is used to

calculate the maximum permissible exposure limits for the entire
period. sound level meters are designed to measure the sound
pressure level (spl) of sound. they are usually calibrated to a

specific sound source, such as a car horn or a siren. the sound
level meter is set to the appropriate sound source, and it is the
sound level of the sound source, not of the sound itself, that is
recorded by the meter. thus, the sound level recorded by the

meter is always higher than the actual sound level of the sound
source. if there are no sound level meters at a worksite, a two-
step approach can be used. in the first step, the sound level of
the noise can be determined by using a sound level meter as a
reference. in the second step, a noise dosimeter can be used to
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determine the number of times the noise is above the
established safe level.
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